
Francis Clarke was born in Stroud, New
South Wales and educated at St Stanislaus

College, Bathurst. Clarke, a surveyor, had a
lengthy career in the New South Wales
Parliament prior to becoming involved in
federal politics. He was the Member for
Macleay (1893-94) and Hastings and Macleay
(1894-98) in the Legislative Assembly and 
was a member of the Legislative Council
1899-1900.

In 1901 Clarke was elected as a Protectionist
to represent the federal seat of Cowper in the
House of Representatives at the first federal
election. He was defeated at the election of
1903. After his parliamentary service, Clarke
was a member of the Royal Commission on
Customs and Tariff 1904-07 and in 1913 was 
a member of the Northern Territory
Commission.

Member for Cowper (New South Wales) 1901-1903

Francis Clarke (1857-1939)

The electorate of Cowper was named after Sir Charles Cowper (1807–1875), a Premier 
of New South Wales.

John Clemons was born in Launceston,
Tasmania and graduated from Oxford

University in England. A lawyer, Clemons 
also had extensive mining interests.

In 1901 Clemons was elected to represent
Tasmania in the Senate at the first federal
election as a Freetrader and held his seat
until 1914. He was a member of the Royal
Commission on Customs and Tariff 1904-07,
and a minister without portfolio in the Cook
ministry 1913-14.

Clemons retired to England and made a few
short visits to his homeland.

Senator for Tasmania 1901-1914

John Singleton Clemons (1862-1944)

The state of Tasmania was also represented in the first Senate by:

John Henry Keating

Henry Dobson Cyril St.Clair Cameron

David John O’Keefe

James Macfarlane


